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April 28, 2020

BID OPEN: Johnson County Road and Bridge Department — Paving Oil

Bids for the Johnson County Road and Bridge Department — Paving Qil were opened at 1:30 p.m. on this
date as advertised. The following bids were received:

Asphalt and
Fuel Supply, Apac-Central, Costal Energy
Company Name LLC INC Vance Brothers, Ine Corp
Tulsa, Springfield, Willow Springs,
Company Location Oklahoma Missouri Kansas City, MO Missouri
MC 30 (cost per gallon) $2.00 $2.02 $2.58 $2.26
MC 3000 (cost per
gallon) $1.86 $1.76 $2.43 $2.02
EA 800 (cost per gallon) No Bid No Bid $2.03 $2.09
CRS - 2 {cost per gallon) No Bid No Bid $1.78 $1.83
AEP (cost per gallon) No Bid No Bid $2.18 $2.06
Pump-Off Charge $75.00 $70.00 $65.00 $75.00
$75.00 per hour
Hourly Unload Rate $75.00 $70.00 $70.00 | after 2 free hours
Full Freight +
Restocking Fee szllgfcf;:;gg
case basis $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
. $0.22 per $0.08 per gallon (included in
Freight Charge gallon $0.12 per gallon pricing above) $525.00
Number of Gallons minimum
Short Freight Load | 5,500 gallons 5,500.00 5,500.00 5,500.00
Freight charge of | Loads less than 5,500 gallons
$0.12 per gallon will be charged freight at
N $0.22 up | will be added to the $440.00 and the material
otes . ) . .
charge for above prices if price will be on a separate
every gallon Apac-Central is to | line item at the above pricing
under 5,500 | deliver the material minus $0.08 per gallon

Commissioner Kavanaugh motioned to take the bids under advisement for further consi

- dorati
20. Comm1ss er Marr seconded otion approved unammously C
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